
FC,MR&T, WEST BANK, MISSISSIPPI RIVER LEVEES,

WILSON POINT TO YOUNGS POINT, LA, LEVEE ENLARGEMENT, ITEM 457-R
IFB NO. DACW38-02-B-0042

HILL BROS. CONST. ADVANCE CONST. GULF GROUP,

AND ENGR. CO. INC. SERVICES, INC. INC.
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY U/M U/P AMOUNT U/P AMOUNT U/P AMOUNT
0001 MOB AND DEMOB 1 LS FOR $ 100,000.00 FOR $ 600,000.00 FOR $ 170,433.55

                            
0002 CLEARING AND 1 LS FOR 650,000.00 FOR 1,350,000.00 FOR 346,986.75

GRUBBING

0003 GRAVEL SURFACING, 1 LS FOR 30,000.00 FOR 25,000.00 FOR 65,581.11
EXISTING

0004 MOWING AND TURFING 1 LS FOR 350,000.00 FOR 350,000.00 FOR 64,698.61

0005 RAMPS 1 LS FOR 70,000.00 FOR 50,000.00 FOR 8,894.34

0006 STONE DITCH 1 LS FOR 30,000.00 FOR 13,000.00 FOR 138,864.88
PROTECTION

0007 LANDSIDE DITCH 1 LS FOR 5,000.00 FOR 10,000.00 FOR 59,295.49
EMBANKMENT

0008 RELOCATION OF 1 LS FOR 25,000.00 FOR 60,000.00 FOR 13,116.24
EXISTING GRAVEL RD

0009 DITCH EXCAVATION 1 LS FOR 40,000.00 FOR 17,000.00 FOR 10,930.17
AND CLEANOUT

0010 BORROW AREA DIKE 1 LS FOR 30,000.00 FOR 35,000.00 FOR 74,119.39
CONSTRUCTION AND
ROAD REHABILITATION

0011 EROSION CONTROL 1 LS FOR 30,000.00 FOR 25,000.00 FOR 536,368.49

0012 WATER CONTROL 1 LS FOR 30,000.00 FOR 45,000.00 FOR 84,310.33
             GATES AND RISERS

0013 LEVEE EMBANKMENT, 1470800 CY $ 3.80 5,589,040.00 $2.10 3,088,680.00 $2.97 4,368,276.00
SEMICOMPACTED

0014 BERM EMBANKMENT, 451200 CY $ 3.80 1,714,560.00 $2.10 947,520.00 $2.97 1,340,064.00
SEMICOMPACTED

0015 BERM EMBANKMENT, 371100 CY $ 3.80 1,410,180.00 $2.00 742,200.00 $2.97 1,102,167.00
UNCOMPACTED



FC,MR&T, WEST BANK, MISSISSIPPI RIVER LEVEES,

WILSON POINT TO YOUNGS POINT, LA, LEVEE ENLARGEMENT, ITEM 457-R
IFB NO. DACW38-02-B-0042

HILL BROS. CONST. ADVANCE CONST. GULF GROUP,

AND ENGR. CO. INC. SERVICES, INC. INC.
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY U/M U/P AMOUNT U/P AMOUNT U/P AMOUNT

0016 LEVEE AND ROADWAY
SURFACING

0016AA OPTION A- 13570 TN NO BID NO BID NO BID
SAND-CLAY-GRAVEL

0016AB OPTION B - 10550 TN $ 17.00 $179,350.00 $ 19.00 $200,450.00 $31.26 $329,793.00
CRUSHED STONE

0017 CATTLE GUARDS 6 EA $4500.00 $ 27,000.00 $6000.00 $ 36,000.00 $2091.31 $ 12,541.86

0018 CORRUGATED METAL 92 LF $ 75.00 $ 6,900.00 $ 50.00 $ 4,600.00 $ 60.36 $ 5,553.12
PIPE, 24-INCH,
BITUMINOUS COATED
W/PAVED INVERT

0019 CORRUGATED METAL 214 LF $ 110.00 $ 23,540.00 $ 50.00 $ 10,700.00 $ 55.59 $ 11,896.26
PIPE, 24-INCH,
POLYMER COATED

0020 CORRUGATED METAL 90 LF $ 85.00 $ 7,650.00 $ 90.00 $ 8,100.00 $ 63.85 $ 5,746.50
PIPE, 30-INCH
BITUMINOUS COATED
W/PAVED INVERT

0021 CORRUGATED METAL 96 LF $ 115.00 $ 11,040.00 $ 100.00 $ 9,600.00 $112.32 $ 10,782.72
PIPE, 36-INCH
POLYMER COATED

0022 CORRUGATED METAL 120 LF $ 325.00 $ 39,000.00 $ 300.00 $ 36,000.00 $446.23 $ 53,547.60
PIPE, 96-INCH,
BITUMINOUS COATED
W/PAVED INVERT

TOTAL BIDS $10,398,260.00 $ 7,663,850.00 $ 8,813,967.41

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE OPENED, READ AND RECORDED
ON THIS ABSTRACT ALL OFFERS RECEIVED IN RESPONSE _____________________ __________
TO THE SOLICITATION. SHIRLEY M. WILSON DATE



FC,MR&T, WEST BANK, MISSISSIPPI RIVER LEVEES,

WILSON POINT TO YOUNGS POINT, LA, LEVEE ENLARGEMENT, ITEM 457-R
IFB NO. DACW38-02-B-0042

JAMES INDUSTRIAL W.G. YATES AND SONS GOVT. ESTIMATE

CONSTRUCTORS, LLC. CONSTRUCTION CO.
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY U/M U/P AMOUNT U/P AMOUNT U/P AMOUNT
0001 MOB AND DEMOB 1 LS FOR $1,233,776.00 FOR $ 44,000.00 FOR $ 92,032.00

                            
0002 CLEARING AND 1 LS FOR 559,158.00 FOR 323,000.00 FOR 340,783.00

GRUBBING

0003 GRAVEL SURFACING, 1 LS FOR 24,264.00 FOR 51,000.00 FOR 26,895.00
EXISTING

0004 MOWING AND TURFING 1 LS FOR 186,126.00 FOR 319,000.00 FOR 318,079.00

0005 RAMPS 1 LS FOR 12,682.00 FOR 121,500.00 FOR 26,735.00

0006 STONE DITCH 1 LS FOR 23,406.00 FOR 24,000.00 FOR 23,453.00
PROTECTION

0007 LANDSIDE DITCH 1 LS FOR 1,238.00 FOR 5,000.00 FOR 1,849.00
EMBANKMENT

0008 RELOCATION OF 1 LS FOR 6,585.00 FOR 14,000.00 FOR 7,763.00
EXISTING GRAVEL RD

0009 DITCH EXCAVATION 1 LS FOR 17,649.00 FOR 17,000.00 FOR 82,019.00
AND CLEANOUT

0010 BORROW AREA DIKE 1 LS FOR 32,004.00 FOR 17,500.00 FOR 100,347.00
CONSTRUCTION AND
ROAD REHABILITATION

0011 EROSION CONTROL 1 LS FOR 12,320.00 FOR 23,700.00 FOR 23,157.00

0012 WATER CONTROL 1 LS FOR 65,357.00 FOR 41,000.00 FOR 53,183.00
             GATES AND RISERS

0013 LEVEE EMBANKMENT, 1470800 CY $ 3.36 4,941,888.00 $3.00 4,412,400.00 $2.41 3,544,628.00
SEMICOMPACTED

0014 BERM EMBANKMENT, 451200 CY $ 3.36 1,516,032.00 $3.30 1,488,960.00 $2.41 1,087,392.00
SEMICOMPACTED

0015 BERM EMBANKMENT, 371100 CY $ 3.50 1,298,850.00 $3.00 1,113,300.00 $2.10 779,310.00
UNCOMPACTED



FC,MR&T, WEST BANK, MISSISSIPPI RIVER LEVEES,

WILSON POINT TO YOUNGS POINT, LA, LEVEE ENLARGEMENT, ITEM 457-R
IFB NO. DACW38-02-B-0042

JAMES INDUSTRIAL W.G. YATES AND SONS GOVT. ESTIMATE

CONSTRUCTORS, LLC. CONSTRUCTION CO.
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY U/M U/P AMOUNT U/P AMOUNT U/P AMOUNT

0016 LEVEE AND ROADWAY
SURFACING

0016AA OPTION A- 13570 TN NO BID NO BID NO BID
SAND-CLAY-GRAVEL

0016AB OPTION B - 10550 TN $ 17.55 $185,152.50 $ 17.50 $184,625.00 $33.20 $350,260.00
CRUSHED STONE

0017 CATTLE GUARDS 6 EA $2130.70 $ 12,784.20 $4000.00 $ 24,000.00 $1550.00 $ 9,300.00

0018 CORRUGATED METAL 92 LF $ 41.50 $ 3,818.00 $ 33.00 $ 3,036.00 $ 44.00 $ 4,048.00
PIPE, 24-INCH,
BITUMINOUS COATED
W/PAVED INVERT

0019 CORRUGATED METAL 214 LF $ 42.02 $ 8,992.28 $ 35.00 $ 7,490.00 $ 43.00 $ 9,202.00
PIPE, 24-INCH,
POLYMER COATED

0020 CORRUGATED METAL 90 LF $ 59.97 $ 5,397.30 $ 39.00 $ 3,510.00 $ 50.50 $ 4,545.00
PIPE, 30-INCH
BITUMINOUS COATED
W/PAVED INVERT

0021 CORRUGATED METAL 96 LF $ 79.81 $ 7,661.76 $ 69.00 $ 6,624.00 $100.00 $ 9,600.00
PIPE, 36-INCH
POLYMER COATED

0022 CORRUGATED METAL 120 LF $ 265.84 $ 31,900.80 $ 211.00 $ 25,320.00 $315.00 $ 37,800.00
PIPE, 96-INCH,
BITUMINOUS COATED
W/PAVED INVERT

TOTAL BIDS $10,187,041.84 $ 8,269,965.00 $ 6,932,380.00


	FC,MR&T, WEST BANK, MISSISSIPPI RIVER LEVEES,
	FC,MR&T, WEST BANK, MISSISSIPPI RIVER LEVEES,
	FC,MR&T, WEST BANK, MISSISSIPPI RIVER LEVEES,
	FC,MR&T, WEST BANK, MISSISSIPPI RIVER LEVEES,

